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Monica Steele

From: Terry Hendryx
Sent: Monday, November 9, 2020 10:48 AM
To: Monica Steele
Subject: FW: Contract Deadline

Monica, 
 
See Tom’s comments on my previous email.  
 
TLH 
 

From: Tom Horning <horning@pacifier.com>  
Sent: Friday, November 6, 2020 9:56 AM 
To: Terry Hendryx <THendryx@co.clatsop.or.us> 
Subject: RE: Contract Deadline 
 
I went through the same thinking, Terry; now that you mention it.  I let the map you sent me overrule things.  However, 
your comments are consistent with what I would have found.  The terrace is superior and has no slopes of any kind from 
Wadsworth to L&C Rd, unlike L&C Road.   You can probably guess at the outcome.  The Mainline will win.  I have created 
the LIDAR images showing the terrace and vallyes, but the instability of the eroding valley walls has not been drafted 
yet. 
 
Tom 
 

From: Terry Hendryx [mailto:THendryx@co.clatsop.or.us]  
Sent: Friday, November 6, 2020 9:32 AM 
To: 'Tom Horning' <horning@pacifier.com> 
Subject: RE: Contract Deadline 
 
Tom, 
 
After I reviewed your report I thought there was an area I had requested reviewed as well.  Going back through my 
emails, I see where I had asked for the 5 mile stretch of mainline between Wadsworth and the 4-way where the 
mainline runs to the old CZ Camp.  Unfortunately, the map I provided to you did not include that piece of 
mainline.  Based on your report, I believe in this area the liquefaction and subsidence potential is low since it sits on a 
terraced plain with virtually no side slopes. 
 
I will start the process of extending the contract and moving forward with your payment today. 
 
Thanks again, 
TLH 
 

From: Tom Horning <horning@pacifier.com>  
Sent: Friday, November 6, 2020 9:17 AM 
To: Terry Hendryx <THendryx@co.clatsop.or.us> 
Subject: RE: Contract Deadline 
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Got it.  Filled out, attached.  Thanks for your help. 
 
Tom H. 
 

From: Terry Hendryx [mailto:THendryx@co.clatsop.or.us]  
Sent: Friday, November 6, 2020 8:51 AM 
To: 'Tom Horning' <horning@pacifier.com> 
Subject: RE: Contract Deadline 
 
Tom, 
 
Unfortunately I needed to put the invoice you sent into our payment system yesterday to make the deadline.  Please 
sign the attached Reinstatement and send it back to me and I’ll get the payment process started. 
 
I reviewed your report and it reaffirmed what we believed all along.  Thank you working us in between your other work, 
Covid and running for City Council.  Congratulations on your win. 
 
TLH 
 

From: Tom Horning <horning@pacifier.com>  
Sent: Friday, November 6, 2020 7:31 AM 
To: Terry Hendryx <THendryx@co.clatsop.or.us> 
Subject: RE: Contract Deadline 
 
Well, blew the deadline, but unintentionally for what it is worth.  Got my days mixed up.  Thought it was Wednesday. 
Sorry about that.  See what you think, attached.   
 
Tom Horning, CEG 
Horning Geosciences 
 

From: Terry Hendryx [mailto:THendryx@co.clatsop.or.us]  
Sent: Tuesday, November 3, 2020 11:22 AM 
To: 'Tom Horning' <horning@pacifier.com> 
Subject: RE: Contract Deadline 
 
Great, look forward to the final product. 
 
TLH 
 

From: Tom Horning <horning@pacifier.com>  
Sent: Tuesday, November 3, 2020 11:09 AM 
To: Terry Hendryx <THendryx@co.clatsop.or.us> 
Subject: RE: Contract Deadline 
 
I think I can make it.  Turned out to be as suspected from LIDAR imagery. 
 
Tom 
 

From: Terry Hendryx [mailto:THendryx@co.clatsop.or.us]  
Sent: Tuesday, November 3, 2020 9:45 AM 
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To: 'Tom Horning' <horning@pacifier.com> 
Subject: RE: Contract Deadline 
 
Morning Tom, 
 
Just checking in to see how your weekend went?  If we’re to make the Thursday’s completion deadline, I will need the 
report and an invoice for work performed prior to noon on Thursday.  If it looks like you’ll need an extension, I will need 
to get it out today. 
 
Thanks, 
TLH 
 

From: Tom Horning <horning@pacifier.com>  
Sent: Friday, October 30, 2020 3:06 PM 
To: Terry Hendryx <THendryx@co.clatsop.or.us> 
Subject: RE: Contract Deadline 
 
I think we will be okay.  Depends on this weekend and the weather.  Still have some field work to complete.  Will advise 
Monday.  Thanks for checking in 
 
Tom 
 

From: Terry Hendryx [mailto:THendryx@co.clatsop.or.us]  
Sent: Friday, October 30, 2020 2:47 PM 
To: 'Tom Horning' <horning@pacifier.com> 
Subject: Contract Deadline 
 
Good Afternoon Tom, 
 
Just checking on the progress of our report and to see if we needed to extend the upcoming contract termination date 
of November 5th? 
 
Thanks, 
TLH 
Terry Hendryx, PLS 
Assistant Director 
Clatsop County Public Works 
1100 Olney Avenue 
Astoria, Oregon 97103 
Office #503-325-8631 Ext. 2509 
Cell #971-704-4295 
Fax 503-325-9312 
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